Fepublic of 1he Philigpines
Beyartment of Chucation
REGION VA CALABARZON
SCHOOLS DIVISION OF BATANGAS
ANNUAL PROCUREMENT PLAN FOR FY 2026

[EDnoicanve [__JFINAU] UPDATED [Version No. 1

—
PROCUREMENT PROJECT DETAILS PROJECTED TIMELINE [ FUNDING DETAILS S ROCUREMENT STRATEGY | FEMARKS
End-User or it i berdil Rl End of Procursment e e [ {Other relevant descriptions of the procurement project, If
Project Title implementing Unit General Dascription of the Project | Mode of Procurement !gﬂ.!u.r_s_sg e Stat of Activity Activity Source of Fund ve!wi uc.__uhh.! the |OR TOOLS applicable)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column § Column & Column 7 Column 8 Column 8 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 _
General Requirements
Conduct of Planning. Progam SGOD - Planniny Catering Services and Mesting Small Value Procuremant N Lowest Caiculated Responsive 1 o GAA 2026 - it »
9 ¢ (Gocds o ot gt 272025 12028 Curram Appropriation 20,000.00
pro-anning ACtitias for the Preparation of FY 2027 Divisonwrp | SGOD - Planning Catering Servioes (Gaods) Small Value Procurement No w.uﬁ..ﬂﬂ..%ﬂ..ﬁan Responaive 0172026 022026 GAA 2026 - Currant Apprapriation | # 270,000.00
Post-Panning Activities for the Finatlzation of FY 2027 Division WFP | SGOD - Planning Travel and Tours package Smail Value Procuremant No munr!“ﬂ_,mhme&ﬂ Responsive 082026 0972028 GAA2026- Gurrant Appropriation | # 583,000.00
Q-naa.tﬂ_avs_nna%in aVe10SY 2026 02700080 |Saon . pranning | Catering Services (Goods) Smail Value Procurement No _m.aa.ann _.Mna_w__za Remonsve 052028 012026 (A 2028 - Current Approriation | P 52,500.00
. Catering Services and Meeting & Lowest Calculated Responsive 0472026 0812026 i :
Divislon i 1wl Plan Adgust { A} SGOD - SMME Fadiities, and cther supplies (Goods) Small Value Procurement No Bid o LORB (GAA 2026 - Currant Appropriation 754,500.00
N Catering Services and Meeting Lowest Calculated Responsive
ation, an [ SGOD - Small rement N AR Ci i X
Division 8, bt i OMEPA) D - SMME = e i oren Oec) Value Progu o P 10/2026 1172028 GAA 2026- Current Appropriation | P 754,500.00
MIPDPWAP SGOD - HRTD Transportation Small Value Procurement No Mﬂ_aﬂa_.%m._zﬁ Responshe 1212025 01/2028 GaA2026 - CurentAppropriation | P 45,000.00
SGOD - HRTD Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No _.uawn Calculsted Responsivel 042026 Us/2026 (GaA 2026 Cunant Appropriation | @ 304,800.00
i Bidor LCRB
rogram for Beginning Teachers
SGOD - HRTD Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No Lowest Emu.zl i 10/2026 1172028 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation | # 184,800.00
fonal Development Lowest Comparative or
Master Teacnhers Professional o] Program (MTPDP) 3.0 - : Catering Services and Meeting N N 28-Ci
| cascning & Hentoring SGOD - HRTD F s, and ciher supplies (Goods) (Compatitive Bidding o Mlmn:“g Responsive Bid or 0472026 05/2026 (GAA 201 urrant Appropriation L 2,855,900.00
= Lowest Comparative or
Division Rollout of S5 Heads F Catering and 1] " i
SGOD - HRTD Sorioes and. Mtk ! GAA 2026 Curtant A ! » 204,
Program3.0 Fadiities. and cther sup) b 5 Competitive Biading No m.m.n..“m-.i Responsive Bid or 082026 07/2026 Currant Appropriation 2,214,000.00
v ) of Learning $GOD - HRTD m“.u!!w_hm!a“ﬁh:“uﬁ_ahﬁaﬂnﬂs Small Value Procurement No wutw.ﬂ_.nﬁz_w._lﬂ it 022026 w2026 GAA 2026 - Curtent Appropriation [ # 1,536,200.00
ofSHOPWAP SGOD - HRTD Vransportation Smail Value Procurement No L el 062026 712026 GAA 2026 -Current Aopropration | P 4500000
2026 SD0 Batangas Health ana Woliness Program SGOD - HRTD ”H.M.H.mmsu.“ai Pacognion Srmall Value Procurement No MHM.&_.MM._R& Rasponsive 1272025 a0 (A 2026- Curent Appropriation. | P 169,700.00
Materials (Goods)
2026 800 Batangas Teachars Day Cetooration SGOD - HRTD oz.“_.”..“.u-ﬂﬂ“una Facogniion Small Value Procursment No wurwg_.ﬂw_iﬁ Raspansive 0972026 1072028 GAA 2026 Current Appropriation | P 162,600.00
2026 for Employ ihe Montn SGOD - HRTD | Awa s and Hecognition Small Value Procurement No M_nog Quu—rww__ﬂﬂn Responsive 1272025 012026 (GAA 2026 - Gurrent Appropriation * 72,000.00
500 Batangas Gawad Batag Jono SGOD - HRTD .m:._..su mn,._nw and Mesting Small Value Procurement No Lowest Wn._!& Fspionsive 1072026 102028 (A4 2026 - Curent Appropration | # 275,200.00
adifties (Goods)
2026 Retirement Honors SGOD - HRTD mu n._..,."_h Swrvicen nd Meatiy Small Value Procurement No __.wmﬂaro._n_.g& i 112026 1272028 GAA 2028 - Cament Aparopriation | P £89,800,00
adifies (Goads)
2026 Gawad BALSONG SGOD - HRTD mur_a_n.h i n;Ho..:“an;ﬁ"_.nm ,|amet value Procursment No _mﬂ.wnrﬂw._ia e i 1172026 1272026 Gaa 2028 - Cument Aporopriation | P £52,000.00
Fr2026 p— o Rewi SGOD mnmﬁ_h w-ﬂuﬂ-” h:“_ z_oa__._w | 5 Value Procurement No Wﬂz“_urmhm_iun Responsive 1172028 1212026 GAA2026- CurentAppropriation | # 1,010,000.00
Mic-yeat and Yoat-ana Porormance Review and PIR SGOD mo..l.._n Sendces and Mesting Small Value Procurement No Lowest Calculated Responsive 0672026 0712028 GAA2026- CurrentAppropriation | 240,000.00
adlities (Goods)
Review and N Catering Services and Mesting Vislue Procurarnent Lowest Calculated Responsive 5 r
SGOD - SMME F s) Small Value No 03/2026 0472026 (GAA 2026 - Current Apgropriation " 134,400.00
A 5GOD Citering Senices snd Mesting Smal Value Procurement No Lowsxt Caicilated Responsive 1172026 1272026 GAA 2026 -Cament Apprapriation | P 160,000.00
Facilities (Goods)
Repolr and Maintanance o SDO acities SGOD - EFS fberand Jﬁﬁmﬁﬁﬂwsaﬁ Small Vallue Procurement No _w.«._.ﬂ.ﬁ_.nQLM_EE Responahe A 2026 -CumentApprapeiation | P 999,999.00
 Canduct ot Division Reorientation on D040, 5. 2044 and DOSA, 5. 2015| SGOD - EFS Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No wﬁnrﬂm_ia Reaponse 032026 os/2026 GAA 2026 - Curremt Appropriation. | 51,.800.00
Training Workshop on Disaster Preparedness for Federated FTA 5
Provincial b Paremsand Teachers | SGOD - DRRM Chising Sapioss e iy Small Value Procurement No e Dhlenlatad Paspene 072026 oarn2s A 2026 Cunent Appropration. | ® 160.000.00
| Assoc ation Elaction and Farum (oo *
Training-Worksnop on the Developmen of Scnool DRRM/CCAM Catering Services and Meeting Lowest Calculated Responsive| 4
i A Joalimition SGOD - DRRM Fadiities 5 Smail Value Procurement No Bid o LCRB 052026 06/2026 (GAA 2026 - Current Appropriafion " 280,000.00
g ol Project Support for thi J Lowest Calculated Responsive) . .
Rostiance Wb ond/or LIGTAS Cantar SGOD - DRRM Small Value Procurement No Bid or LCRB 052026 062026 (GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation P 250,000.00
 orvtuct of DRRM and CCAM Aessarch Compandiien SGOD - DRRM ol Small Value Procurement No e Rieponihe 0612028 0712026 GAA 2026 -Current Appropriation | # 168,000.00




cing Reeljance: 2026 DAF Progrim Imptemeniation AR, Loa0p - DRRAM [CHli calioss wnd Mosiig Small Vailue Procurement Mo 102026 1172028 (34 2026 Curient Appropitation 770000.00
eciities (Goods)
| Coordination MestIng retative to 2026 Division Search for Gawad a Catering Senices and Meeting Proou N 0212026 2 A < 80,000,00
A Erniine. SGOD - DRRM Facitios (Goodal Small Value rement o 0172026 (5AA 20126 - Curtent Appropriation 000,
B:Mnmnoﬁ_wrﬁ_u“ﬁa-sl KALASAG Outstanding Elemantary | cann | nopy Vransporttion Small Value Procurement No 0112028 0212026 GAA 2026- Current Apprapriation 56,000 00
B
worksan o e ol EDL SGOD - DRRM oy i sad M Smal Value Procurement No 0212026 022026 (GAA 2028 Guront Appropriation 300,000 00
adilities (Goods)
§ Catering Services and Meeting i Val N GAA 2026 1 300,
[Consuttative Worksnop EDURESILIENGE Framawark SGOD - DRRM Eacilies (G Smal ue Procurement o 5 02/2026 02026 (AA 2026 - Cufrent Appropriation ,000.00
worksrop on the JRESILENCE SGOD - DRRM mﬂtsh Services and Meeting Small Valus Procurement No _.a..oa_.ny_u__-in Regpenahey 032026 0472026 5342026 - Current Apprapriation 180,000.00
fentati P ]! Lowest Comparative or
ot Gutture, vatues ana Risk Disaster SGOD - DRRM iy Competitive Biddig No Competiive Responshve Bid o 0412026 o226 (54 2026 -Gurent Appropriatian 4,320,00000
and Resiliancy [with breakour sesslon per tearning area] (3days) LCCRB
Procurement of of Medicat Supplies andAids SGOD - Medical {Goods) Small Value Procurement No Lowest Calculaied Responsive 1272025 01/2026 A8 2026 Cunrent Appropriation 500,000.00
[Conduct of Empowaring Well wss: Creating a Comprenensive SGOD - Mk Catering Senvices and Mesling Small Visiue Procuramen N Lowest Calculated Responsive 0472026 AL . Gurent " 75,200.00
School Raterral Systam and Intarvention Plan far Studont Wall-Baing Fadiilies (Goods) - ' ° Bid or LCRB s (A0S Comerk Arpjoprisen o
Counseling Thraugn Active Listening: An Aparoach to Crafling Caterng Senvces and Meeting | Value Procurem Lowest Calcutated Responsive A4 2026 - Current. ? ()
Ps, jically Sale Enwironment 000 = Madical Fallities (Goods) Srosd aluw i No |Bid or LCRB 04720268 05/2026 2026~ Gurrent Appropriation 180,000,
WASH T n Programm for New Project 9 Catering Services and Mesting Lowest Calculated Responsive) " - 00,000.00
e s thvns SGOD - Medical e et wnpios Wcodgy | STl Value Procurement No Erpespansy 032026 04/2026 (5% 2026- Gurrent Appropriation 100,000,

; z Catefing Services and Meeting " Brodii Lowest Calculated Respansive R o o
Diislon ci-Based g Pragram [SBFP) SGOD - Medical FadiRties, and cther supplies (Goods) Small Value l_._s. No Bid or LCRB 05/2026 DE/2026 urtant Appropdiatl 500,
"axb.. of Oplan Kalusugan sa Degkd In convergancawiin HLI SGOD - Medical Catering Senvices (Goods) Small Value Procurement No _m!nﬂaﬂnrmmwiﬂ Reaonsive 06/2026 072026 GAA 2026 - Gurrent Apropration 150,000.00

mn amns
|OKD-HLI Program Implementation Rewiew (P1R) SGOD - Medical atarg corces e Nonibe Small Valug Procurement No _.oawnrmmwxl& Riaponsive 1172026 1272026 GAA 2026 - Gurrent Appropriation 15960000
Program Review Implsmaniation onSchoot Based Feedng Program | oo g Services and Mesting Small Valus Procurement No Lowest Calculsted Responsive R T — S——
(SBFP) 0 Fadiiities, and other supplies (Goods) Bid or LCRB N2028 ik d
Division Refreshar Orientation of Cantesn Managers and Feeding
Goordinators/Food Handters on Proper Food Handling inSchool
(Cantsans and School FeadingAreas Cum Tachnical Assistancaon | SGOD - Medical Catering Services and Meeting Small Value Procurement No Lownet Calcud e Responaieg) 0712026 082026 (3AA 2026 - Current Aporopriation 100,000.00
B : Fadillties, and other supplies (Goods) Bid of LCRB
Policyand aaltny noices in
5choots andin DepEd Offices
””_M;M_-_“Nnéhini;m Paaratan Program (GPP) MONNIONNgand | oy | upedical Tiatikpditaion Small Value Procurement No wﬂ.“n_.ﬂm:_n_un Fospontion 1212025 01/2026 5AA 2026 - Curram Agoropraion 100,000.00
Jetatrict Sead Exc g ACTHY,
u_”wwhom&nﬁ __.o__i_h. ESQSM_H;EES‘;E" SGOD - GAD mu.e_u_“_:ww mnsnlm S Meeting Small Value Procurement No m-ﬁnrﬂm__iﬁ Seapaie 0372026 2026 34 2026 - Gurret Aparapriation 1.764,000.00
Conduct of filvision Women's Manth Celabratian SGOD - GAD CatwringSenvices and Omer Materials  |orgy) yajye Procurement No wﬂt“l_.ﬂm.__-ﬁ Responsive 0272026 w2026 Ak 2026 Gurent Approgration #7.300.00
Division Celabration of Pridé Monthy SGOD - GAD CatwringSentcos andOmerMaleials. | sray yvaje Procurement No Lowest Calaiated Responsiv 0572026 0672026 GAA 2026 - Currant Appropriation 80,800.00
(Goods) Bid or LCRB
Consuct of Division Gampaign o End VAWG SGOD - GAD Othar Materlats and Recognition materials | Small Value Procurement No —mﬂﬂrurﬂw._uﬂ Feshontie 1012026 1172026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation 70,900.00
Division 2027 GAD Planning and Buigeting Workshop SGOD - GAD Catering Sendces (Goods) ‘Smail Value Procurement No e R Bapna 0712026 w028 5AA 2026 -Currant ApprapAation 49,000.00
i School Heads ipsand Catering Senvices and Meeting Small Val Lowest Calculated Responsive| GAA 2026~ ’ 27.000.00
staaolders Engagement (Batcn2) BadD o Fadiities, and oiher supplies (Goods) e Propirenient i Bid or LCRB o st ConemAppopraton “
2026 Diision B off SGOD - SMN Catering Senvcos and Omer Materials | gy \lue Procurement No Lowesl Cajaifated Responibe 052028 Oav2028 (34 2028 -Currant Appropration 111.300.00
{Goods) Bid of LCRB
. = Catering Senices and Mesting Small Value Pr No Lowest Calculated Responsive 102028 AR 2026 - —_ - 434,400.00
Ganduct of 2026 RABATANG Partners Recognition Rites Year SGOD - SMN Facilities. &nd other sup (G ) ue Procurement Bid or LCRB 102026 3 Currant Apprapriation y

P T Toois for Calering Senvces and Meeting Procurement Lowest Calculated Responsive| . 1.250,000.00
Koy iplomamers ciD Fadiites, and othet supplies (Geods) Small Value No Bid of LCRB 0472026 05/2026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation X
[PAGMAY Ac )W.ouiﬁ_ Quﬂg-_ nd incusivey for cio n!o..sh Servioss ed Oher Small Value Procurement No w“.ﬂ.l Cotculabud Raaponsive 0872026 0912026 (3AA 2026 - Current Appropriation 350,000.00

; _ Lowest Comparative of
Special Neads ogram, Activitias, Catering Senices and Meeting . Ns - -Current Appropriati 2,096,887.00
Policles and Guldelings (Batches 152} CiD F . and cther Jies (Goods) (Competitve Bidding mm-ﬂshm.!i Responsive Bid or 0472028 05/2026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation D95,
© Mootlogof SNED |y CateringSenvces sndOtharSupplies gy vaiue Procurement No e i Réaponae 082026 w2026 (344 2026 - Current Appropriation 150,000.00
Ma”uﬂ“ﬁnﬂﬂa,ﬂwﬁ“?i tdation: Empowering Loy CateringSenvices andOter Supplies | gy vsgjy e Procurement No ﬁafm.n_m...ia Responsive 0772026 w2026 3A 2026 -Gurent Appropriation 150,300.00
IC|
- CataringSanvices andOmerSupplies [ o0\l Procurement No Lowest Calculated Responsive 072026 072026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation 150,090.00
Goods Bid or LCRB
Transpartation, Meeting taciities, Catering | o o1 \sat 6 Procurement No Lowest Calcuiated Responsive SR 2026 - Current arsion 40,00
Mational Festival of Talents CiD Sonices, Otor Materiats (Goods) L Bid o LCRB 02/2026 0372026 urrent Agpropi 378,0¢
Transportation, Meeting laclities, Catering Lowest Calculated Responsive
Rogional Small Value Procurement No 01/2026 0272026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropiiation 451,200

Fostival of Talents cID Services, Other Haterists (Goods) o Bid of LCRE "

pegional Schools Prass Confarsnce {RSPC) Elimination cio (Catering Servicas (Goods) Seall Value Procurement No e O oued Resgeniha] 0172026 varz0z6 58 2026 -Currar Apovagiation 558,000.00




Ragional Schools Press Contarence (RSPC) Finals lails} Catering Sarvices (Goods) Small Value Procurement Na rmn est Caiculsted Responsive 0172026 02r2026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation 454,000.00
Divisian Cliniquingfor 2028 RSPC Qualiars {Indvidusl and Group |y I icas (Good) Smell Valus Procurement Ne Lowed Caiuaied Remonse, 1202025 012026 3aA 2026 Curent Approprition 1,655,000.00
|kl ___ Bid or LCRB
Division Cliniquingfor 2026 RSPCQualiiars {Schoot Paper Events] | CID Cataring Sarvices (Goods) Small Valus Procurement No w:!.ﬁ..rﬂw__g& s o] 1212025 ouz026 Ga 2026- Current Appropriation 408,000.00
Diisian Cl 2026 Prags G Lowest Calculated Responsive "
Small Value t GAA 2026 - Currant Appropriation :
|insec) quavtiars ciD Cataring Services (Ganas) Procurement No B o LoRE 0212026 032026 i pptop 3185,000.00
2026 National Schools Press Conlarence (NSPC) o Transportation, Mesting taclitles, Catering Smeil Value Procurement No Lowest Calculated Responsive 032026 0472028 |54 2026 - Guirrent Appropriation 188,000.00
|Senvices (Goods) Bid or LCRB
Transpartation, Meeting tacities, Catering | oy \ oy N Lowest Calculated Responsive) 2026- "
Divislon Festhvat of Tatents Sl ving Tangnatan CiD Savices, Otrier Matarials ) ue Procurement o Bid of LCRB 11/2026 1272026 GAA Currenl Appropriation 256,700.00
. Ci vices and Other Supplies Lowest Calculated Responsive 3AA 2026 - A -
DWision Sclence and Technology Fair ciD o Small Value Procurement No Bid or LORB 0872026 092026 Current Appropriation 28,720.00
Dwislon jonfo~Sci and Fairwinness |y Catering Sanvicas and Other Suppiies Small Value Procurement e Lowest Calculated Responsive 082026 1072026 A4 2026 - Current Appropriation 356,000.00
(Goods) Bid or LCRE
‘s activities and Catering Services and Meeting 1 Lowest Calculated Responsive i "
ehkssmants [=]s] F gt lies (Goods) Small Value Procurement No Bid of LCRB (GAA 2626 - Current Appropriation 998,000.00
Canetl nd
soint Celebration of Natianal TEGKVOC Day and AGR Fastval ciD s L] Smail Value Procurement No Wnaao..an..nnumwzkon Responsive 07/2026 08/2026 5AA 2028 - Gurrent Appropriation 407,587.50
Search for Best SHS TVL Labaratory Room cio Otner Supalics {Gaods] Small Value Procurement No wﬂzﬂsrm“mﬁn! Fowpanmie 1212025 02028 GAA 2026- Current Appropriation 5,780.00
Hands-n Heroes: Awosds for Outstanding Achisvers inTLE-TWL [ 1D Cawiing Services and O1her Suppies | sall Valus Procurement No Lowent Quicudaiad Responshe 0412026 052028 34 2026 - Gurrent Agpropriation 217,00000
(Goods) Bid of LCRB
Enhancing Teac s Versatilng: A Cross-Skilling Training for Cataring Sanvices and Other Supplies Small Value Procurement No Lowest Calculated Responsive 08/2026 1 A 2026 Crront {ath 480,000.00
|EPP-TLE-TVL Instiuctors | (Goods) e Bid or LCRB e TR AppOpY it
PAHAM 2.0 - Maikling Kurso sa Pagbuo ng mga Interbensiyong Catering Senvices and Mesting Small Val Lowest Calculated Respon sive (GAA2026- atl
agamitansa Pogutirong FFipino 7 (Batcn?2) o Fadities, and aiher supplies (Goods) T he Bid or LCRE Camatiporopfisied Aoos1a.m
Meetings for i 3 and Catering Senices and Meeting Small Val No Lowest Calculated Responsive GAA 2026 fati —
eamers’ pertormance o0 Fadities (Goods) s Procurement |Bid o LCRB 052026 0672026 Current Approgriation 00000
Finalization Workshop of devaloped learning resource pac kage for Catering Senices and Meeting Smail Value Procurement N Lowest Caicuisted Responsive (GAA 2026 - Current. afh
submiasion 1o DMision LR o Facilities, and other supplies (Goods) e ° 8id or LCRB R DR oo
Lowest Comparative or
“ESPRIT: Empowering g 1 Roats and Catoring Serces and Meeting No S o
iitegratod Virtue Valus Traini g or Teachers® cio Fadiities, and other supplies (G ) Compatitive Bidding mﬂnsﬂai Responsive Bid or 0272026 0972026 GAA urrent Appropriation 2,504,885.00
[Exitand Eval uativa Survey on GMRC and Values EQ/RBB Program
. = Catering Senvices and Meeting Smail N Lowest Calculated Responsive 2 i 200
Curricutum tor 8Y 202 ang  |CID F es (Goods) Value Procurement o Bid or LCRB 0472028 052026 (3AA 2026 - Gurrent Aporopriation 134,400.00
Values Ed Preparatory Mest!
Building Blocks of Guidance: AWrlleshop on Homaroam Matarials Lowest Comparative or
cio g Gendom wd Mesting Gompetive Bidding No Compettive Responsive Bid or 0472026 0572026 (A8 2028 -Current Aprogriation 2644,800.00
Fadilities, and other supplies (Goods)
(Kaystage 1) LCCRB
Kape at Pandesal: Serbisyo at Mabuting Asal (Fhipino Vatues Morth Smail Val Ne Lowest Calculated Responsive 7 8 30,000,
Celpbration] ciD Catering Senvices (Goods) il Value Procurement Bid or LCRB 1072026 102026 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation ,000.00
Praparatory |Catering Sendces and Meeting rernenit N Lowes! Calculated Responsive "
Heunsmbaiseitey fells] Faciiies (Goeds) Small Value Procus o Bid or LCRB 03/2026 0472026 GAA 2026 - Gurrent Appropration 376,800.00
Sanior Hign Spectacutar. The Grand Culrination cip Catering Sences (Goods) Small Value Procurement No mraia o-_mmﬂ._m o Fas iy 0212026 Car2026 3AA 2028 -Gurrer Appropriation 266,470.00
School Year-End Convergenca of Diision Supenisors, District L
i latlts alALS cio Catering Services (Goods) Small Valus Procurement No s Saated Responsive 0372026 0472026 (A 2026 - Currem Apprapriation 100.000.00
1o Catpurate
Catering Senvices and Meeting Small Val No Lowest Calculsted Responsive| : ”
Conduct of Enhancement Activity for Storybook Writers ciD F . and other supplies (Goods) ue Procurement Bid or LORB 0512026 08/2028 (GAA 2026 - Currant Appropriation 320,000.00
ivsian Quaty assurance of LRs cio Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No b calcdupe fespense 0772026 oarz028 (348 2026-Curront Agsropriation 442,000.00
Conductaf LR Expa 2026 co Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No _.!.H. o._m__sa Responiive 1172026 12/2026 5AA 2026- Gurrant Appropriation 236,000.00
Workshop e Oigization of Aliomati Delivery Mode (ADH) o Catering Senvices (Goods) Small Value Procurement No Lowss Culoliates Responave 0912026 102026 | 58 2026 - Current Aporopriation 32250000
f for ADM Learing! Bid or LCRB
DM Summit cip Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No _.gu”n_.nu_w._..-n Rewmponshes 1172026 122026 3AA 2028 - Current Appropriation 4,100.00
National Baok Othar Supplies (Goods) and Recognitian N Lowest Calculated Responsive 5 10,800,
Raviews 1 iogging Contest (=le] atarials Small Value Procurement o Bid or LCRB 1072026 1172026 (3AA 2026 - Curtent Apptopriation 00,00
(Capacity Bullding Workshop of Arating Pantlpunan Teacners onthe fom Serv Meatin Lowest Comparative o
Development of Videa instructions for Basic Education InSocial cio g Berdoes and d Competitive Bidding No Competitive Responsie Bid of 0472026 052026 A 2026 - Current Appropriation 2474,955.00
Facilities, and other supplies (Goods)
Studies (AP-VIBES LCCRB
YN S b b Catering Servces and Meeting Lowest Calculated Responsive
E i L N - it 309,370.00
”nem..u.__.aa”i_bn._xasaninﬁ_z:a InAraling Pantipunan across | CID Failties, and cther supplies (Goods) Small Value Procurement o Bid or LORB 0772026 0B/2028 (GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation 370
reytoges
Tralning-Writeshop for Araling Panifpunan Master Teacnars on Catering ces and Mesting o .
g Tec ciD Bard Small Value Procurement No Lowest Reancaewe, 0972026 1072026 A4 2026 - Currern Agpropriation 584,360,00
Integration in aXam ination (AR-MATRI: Fachltins, snd cther sugples (Goods) o LoRs
tralning- Writeshop for Azating Pantipunas on AP SIMPLE: Araling
i & for Catering Services and Meeting Small Proo Lowest Calculated Responsive 0372026 0572026 riation 390,520.00
L finctxding ogram and D Fadilities, and other supplies (Goods) L rement N Bid or LCRB (CAX2025 - Comm Adpope s
Madrasan Education Program})




Tralning. pfor Adting onine
| Davelopment of Digitatized Araling Paniipunan Reader's Digastfor | CID Catering Services and Mesting Small Value Procurement No Lowss! Calcuistad Rosponeivel 0572026 0672026 GAA 2026 -Current Appropriation | # 549,990.00
A Facilities. and other supplies (Goods) Bid or LCRB
Local History and Cultural He )
4_-.ai§ExJ=3 of Elementary and Secondary Teac hers on Folk co Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurament No Lowest Calculated Responsive 0472026 05/2028 | GAA 2026 - Currant Appropriation » 344,200,00
|Pancing and Visual Arts Bid or LCRE
ARTE ALA EH: Showcasing of Leamers' Talents and Skille cio Catering Senices (Goods) Small Value Procurement No wﬂ“n_.%m:_gun Responsive 0172026 0272026 |34 2028 - Current Agpropriation . 297,600.00
Oriantationof Institutionatization oT$pons Club In Public Scrosis | CID Catering Services (Goods) Smail Value Procurement No wﬂﬂl_.%w:_._-n Feagpcnsha 0772026 082026 G4 2026-Current Appropriation | # 54,600.00
| St-ariginaning SIP Exportise. A Hands-On Tralning 1or Teachers on Catering Services and Meeting Srral Lowest Calculated Responsive)
il Value Procurement N 04120: 0520 54 2026 - Current Appropriati . !
¢ gatony rojs an Facilties, and other supplies (Goods) = ¥ Bd o LCRB ca J R D
5-day for Grade 4 and Grada 7 Catering Services and Meeting Small Value Procurement N Lowest Calculaled Responsive 0472026 0572026 | 3AA 2026 - Cu rlati » 86,
Science ) Facilities, and other supplies (Goods) e oLt s Bid or LCRB FrentAppeoprdation b sy
5-day Quathty Assurance workshop tovalidate, refine, and finalize the Catering Services and Mesting Lowest Calculated Responsive GAA 2026- Currant i
sl cip Faitios wid oo aupsbo | Smei value Procurement No Pty 0912026 10/2026 urrentAgpropriation | P 190,000.00
Jrraining workanop for taarning taadess, hignly proficiant and proficiant
jing andutizing Project NIMIAGa Toots for oo Sakaring Sendos ard Mesting ‘Smal Value Procurement No Lowsat Culoclaled Respanitve 1212025 0172026 A 2026 -Curren Agoropration | 1855,000.00
Fadilities, and other supplies (Goods) Bid of LCRB
Divorso K 12 Learnars
Pra-Planning Relative 10 he §¥ 2025-2026 ALS ABE Test ciD Catering Senvices (Goods) Small Vslue Procuremant No Vﬂt“.u.r%ﬂsll Responsh 1272025 0172028 GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation r 80,800.00
[Pust Conference Relative 105Y 2025-2026 ARE Test mpismentation | CID Catering Services (Goods) Small Value Procurement No wﬂm.!rooumsl& Fespcnave 0172026 0272026 GAA 2026 - Currant Agpropdation | » 63,000.00
Catering Services and Meeting Lowest Calculated Responsive, .
L N GAA 2026 - i » 186,000.00
ALS Exll Conference: SY 2028-2026 Acadamic Perdormance Status | CID F . Small Value Procurement o Bid o LORB 0472026 05/20268 Current Appropriation
ALS Mid Sc00l Year Program Imptemantation Review cio CMwhg D o Meeing Smali Value Procurament No _.u:uw. Calcuisieg Responsve, 0972026 1012026 A 2026 -Current Appropriation | # 103.200.00
acilities (Goods)
Procuramant and Printing ot ALS diptamal certificata cio Otner matarisls {Goods) Smell Value Procurement No e o._m.__z.n Rilsproihe, 0272026 032026 A 2026 -CurrentAgprogration [ » 210,00000
(Conduct ot G 2025 Audi xt Contarance osps CaneringSenvces (Goods) Small Value Procursment No ruﬂn Chlakaisd Reponsive 0212026 032025 Gaa 2026 -Current Appropiation [ # 5,000.00
 Conduct of C¥ 2026 Audit Entrance Gontarence 0SDS CateringServices (Goods) Small Value Procurement No ﬁa%hmi& Responsive 0772026 0872026 (GAA2026- Current Appropriation | # 7,500.00
[Conduct of Divsion Workahap on the Preparstion of FY 2027 Buget. |\ Small Value Procurement No Loawbel Sal it Ranpronitm 0172026 0212026 5442028 -Curent Appropdiation | # 96,000.00
|Propasal Bid or LCRB
N N Catering Senvices and Mesting Lowest Calculated Responsive
t liding for Begin oot H A4 2026 CunentAppropriation | # 30,000.00
Conduct of Capac Ity Bullding for Baginning Sc. Bads osDs |Faciiies, and other suppiies (Goods) Small Value Procuremeant No Bid or LCRB 0672026 0772026 GAA 2026 - Current Approprian
Favisit an tha Payroll Preparation o the Division Office and Calering Services and Mesting Small Val Lowest Calculsted Responsive, A Current raion » 275,000.00
imptwrmenting Unite 2808 |Faciities, and other supplies (Goods) B pa st e 8id or LCRB 032028 0472026 (G 2026 - Current Appropria ,
Roview and PRIME-HRM Evidence and Catering Senices and Meeting S Lowest Caiculated Responsive 372026 04120 = 8 ¥ 205,000.00 | -
Preparation Tof PRIME-HRM Level 3 Accradiation o808 Fadilities, and other supplies (Goods) RVAES PRt He Bid or LCRB Y 26 AL A=t Mopodetert o
To give upd: 1he Programs and Projects of tha dep toalt Catering Senvices and Meeting Small Ve Procurament N Lowest Calculated Responsive i . Aat ’ 300,000,00
scnool heads and Unit Heads in SDO Batangas Province: 0808 Fadlities (Goads) o] 9 Bid or LCRB Quarterty ot as noeds arises | GAA 2026 - Current Apprapriation f
Lowest Comparative or
Paymant ol Salarles of Job-orders 0sDS Payment of Satariss of Job-ordars Gompetitive Bidding No Competitive Responsive Bid or Mantnty GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation P 2,889,435.00
LCCRB.
Lowest Comparative or
(Cperational Expanses osDs Operatianal Expansoes Competitive Bidding No Competitive Responsive Bid or GAA 2026 - Current Appropriation [ 4 17.247,704.00
LCCRB
Lowest Comparative or
Travel/Other Expenses 0SsDS Transportation Competitive Bigding Na Competitive Responsive Bid or (GAA 2026 - Current Apprapriation " 2,000,000 00
LCCRB
[ flems (for Direct Acquisition only) Sec 32.2 of RA No. 12008 ]
I | | / 1 | I |
Common Use and [CSE) 1o be p from P&-DBM (Kindly Indicals the summary/iotal amounis only) T
Procurement of Commen Usa Offico Suppies Supply Offica Compeiitive Bidding No “ﬂs_.nnn%ia 0172028 0372026 A4 2026 - Curent Appropristion 2,000,000.00 One-tima requirsment ta e in daily oporations

Note: Insert addRional rows 8s necessary

Prepared by:

Signature over Print
Senlor Education Program Specialist
Bids and Awards Commitioe Secretenat

Date : September 30, 2025

Total Amount of Estimated Budget for EPA Projects:
Total Amount of CSEs ta be purchased from PS-DBM: 2,000,000.00
Total Amount of Estimated Budget: P 80,705,654.50

School§ Division Superintendent
Head of the Frocuring Entity

Dute | September 30, 2025




